
Beautiful skin for a lifetime 
Environ skin care products have been formulated to combat the harmful effects of the harsh climatic changes 
of today’s environment specifically pollution and the ever-increasing doses of radiation from the sun due to 
the thinning of the protective ozone layer. Added to these are the modern-day effects of social and work 
stresses and poor diet. 

Everyday our skin loses vitamins, this aggravates the visible signs of ageing. Dr Des Fernandes, a prominent 
Cape Town plastic and reconstructive surgeon, was the first person in the world to introduce intense vitamin 
A treatment in high effective doses with startling results. This range established Environ as a world leader in 
skin care. 

Environ products are developed as a result of Dr Fernandes’ personal, scientific research. Environ skin care 
products are intended for use on all skin types and are based on a “step-up” or graduated system of varying 
intensities of active ingredients and vitamins to ensure that the client’s skin adapts gradually. The Environ® 
products offer a definite regime to nourish, protect and maintain a healthy, youthful and beautiful skin. Each 
product is made from the highest quality ingredients. They are mostly free from fragrance, preservatives, 
colourants and animal extracts. 

The key to the Environ formula is vitamin A, an addition that revolutionized the market when it was actually 
incorporated in the right dosages. As a plastic surgeon in Cape Town, Dr. Des Fernandes understood the 
importance of healthy skin for a person’s overall appearance, and he set out to create the perfect skin care 
solution. Soon after, Environ hit the world by storm. 

 

Vitamin A has a unique way of smoothing out a person’s skin and protecting it from the harmful rays of the 
sun. The result is softer, more natural looking skin that seems virtually unaffected by the UV rays that often 
leave craters on a person’s face. Collagen is restored through the use of vitamin A, and that combined with a 
regeneration of elastin makes skin look younger and healthier overall.  

Environ replenishes skin’s moisture from the first application, and it continues to protect the skin use after 
use. At it’s heart, Environ’s® mission is to provide proven, cutting-edge technology and sound skin science 
principles in creating skincare for women and men from youth to maturity, as well as children, all skin types 
and ethnicities. 

 


