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Topsoil varies from load to load, it is a 
sandy loam soil brown in color. It does not 
have any nutrional value for your plants. It 
is used to build up around the house.  Also 
available mixed with our rich black com-
post.  One yard of topsoil is equivalent to 4-
5 wheelbarrows full or 15 bushels.  We do 
carry Garden magic topsoil in 40# bags .  
The bagged topsoil is a mixture of reed 
sedge peat and sand black in color. 

Compost is a black rich composition of 
decomposed grass and leaves. It is heated 
up over 150º at this temperature all weed 
seed and pathogens are killed. It has the 
water retention capability of peat moss and 
the nutrient value of a good fertilizer. Ex-
cellent addition to the garden or anywhere 
you are going to plant.  Available bulk and 
bagged. 

Compost Manure is odorless and avail-
able in 40# bags only.  It is made up of 
reed sedge and composted animal waste.  
Excellent addition to gardens adding or-
ganic matter.   


