BID TABULATION

PROJECT: 2020 PICKLEBALL COURTS & PARKING LOT IMPROVEMENTS

SAWMILL PARK - ROHR STREET

Arnolds Park, lowa E-10087

ENGINEER: JACOBSON-WESTERGARD & ASSOCIATES, INC.
105 South 6th Street
Estherville, IA 51334

OWNER: City of Arnolds Park BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME
AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS:
BID DATE: January 8, 2020 @ 10:15 a.m.
BECK EXCAVATING DIAMOND CONCRETE CONST. [LARSON CONTRACTING CENT.|  HULSTEIN EXCAVATING
COMPLETION DATE: ALL WORK June 22, 2020 SPIRIT LAKE, IA SPIRIT LAKE, IA LAKE MILLS, IA EDGERTON, MN
Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No Item Quantity |Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
1. |Excavation 26500 | CY.|$ 3200($% 848000($ 3326|%$ 881390|$% 4953 |% 13,12545($% 2350(|$ 6,227.50
2. |Court Surface Acrylic Filler/Color 800.00 | S.Y. 42.00 33,600.00 19.07 15,256.00 17.81 14,248.00 26.75 21,400.00
3. [Court Net System 4.00 | Each| 3,300.00 13,200.00 1,540.00 6,160.00 1,482.75 5,931.00 5,400.00 21,600.00
4. [Court Line Marking (white - 2" wide) 792.00 | L.F. 2.50 1,980.00 0.64 506.88 1.20 950.40 1.75 1,386.00
5. |Perimeter Fencing (6' high chain link with/2 gates) 364.00 | L.F. 30.28 11,021.92 34.82 12,674.48 23.61 8,594.04 48.50 17,654.00
6. |Interior Fencing (4' high chain link) 156.00 | L.F. 23.58 3,678.48 28.32 4,417.92 20.13 3,140.28 40.25 6,279.00
7. |6" PCC Sidewalk (coarse aggregate limestone) 46.00 | S.Y. 90.00 4,140.00 57.15 2,628.90 60.80 2,796.80 84.00 3,864.00
8. |6" PCC Side with thickened edge 61.00 | S.Y. 120.00 7,320.00 57.15 3,486.15 71.59 4,366.99 116.25 7,091.25
9. |6" PCC Pavement (coarse aggregate limestone) 423.00 | S.Y. 79.00 33,417.00 46.89 19,834.47 68.46 28,958.58 54.25 22,947.75
10. |Modified Subbase 60.00 | Ton 25.00 1,500.00 42.47 2,548.20 58.90 3,534.00 35.50 2,130.00
11. |Pavement Markings (white - 4' wide) 180.00 | L.F. 5.00 900.00 0.75 135.00 10.69 1,924.20 12.50 2,250.00
12. |Clean Black Topsoil 160.00 | C.Y. 35.00 5,600.00 64.17 10,267.20 53.33 8,532.80 45.75 7,320.00
13. |Seeding & Fertilizing - Urban Mix with Mulch 82.00 [ SQ 35.00 2,870.00 36.00 2,952.00 31.01 2,542.82 27.50 2,255.00
14. |Silt Fence Placement & Removal 120.00 | L.F. 5.00 600.00 6.50 780.00 7.13 855.60 8.25 990.00
15. |Relocate Basketball Hoop 1.00 | L.S. 1,800.00 1,800.00 1,020.00 1,020.00 523.00 523.00 869.00 869.00
16. |Traffic Control 1.00 | L.F. 900.00 900.00 3,700.00 3,700.00 1,995.00 1,995.00 736.50 736.50
TOTAL - BASE BID $ 131,007.40 $ 095,181.10 $ 102,018.96 $ 125,000.00
ALTERNATE BID NO. 1
17A.|Pickleball Court - Aslphalt Alternate 800.00 | S.Y.|$ 65.00 |$ 52,000.00
TOTAL - BASE BID & ALTERNATE NO. 1 $ 183,007.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATE BID NO. 2
17B.|Pickleball Court - Reinforced Concrete 800.00 | S.Y.[$ 116.00 |$ 92,800.00 |$% 67.32|$ 53,856.00 ($ 69.86 % 55888.00|$% 61.50|$ 49,200.00
TOTAL - BASE BID & ALTERNATE NO. 2 $ 223,807.40 $ 149,037.10 $ 157,906.96 $ 174,200.00
ALTERNATE BID NO. 3
17C.|Pickleball Court - Post-Tensioned Concrete 800.00 | S.Y. $ 105.08 | $ 84,064.00
TOTAL - BASE BID & ALTERNATE NO. 3 NO BID *  $ 179,245.10 NO BID NO BID
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PROJECT: 2020 PICKLEBALL COURTS & PARKING LOT IMPROVEMENTS

SAWMILL PARK - ROHR STREET
Arnolds Park, lowa E-10087

OWNER: City of Arnolds Park

BID TABULATION

BIDDER'S NAME

BIDDER'S NAME

BIDDER'S NAME

AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS:
BID DATE: January 8, 2020 @ 10:15 a.m.
DeLOSS CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER'S
COMPLETION DATE: ALL WORK June 22, 2020 SPENCER, IA ESTIMATE
Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No Item Quantity |Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
1. |Excavation 26500 | C.Y.|$ 25.00(|$ 6,625.00 $ 12.00($ 3,180.00
2. |Court Surface Acrylic Filler/Color 800.00 | S.Y. 22.00 17,600.00 5.00 4,000.00
3. [Court Net System 4.00 | Each| 1,200.00 4,800.00 625.00 2,500.00
4. |Court Line Marking (white - 2" wide) 792.00 | L.F. 5.00 3,960.00 4.00 3,168.00
5. |Perimeter Fencing (6' high chain link with/2 gates) 364.00 | L.F. 33.00 12,012.00 22.00 8,008.00
6. |Interior Fencing (4' high chain link) 156.00 | L.F. 27.00 4,212.00 20.00 3,120.00
7. |6" PCC Sidewalk (coarse aggregate limestone) 46.00 | S.Y. 80.00 3,680.00 50.00 2,300.00
8. |6" PCC Side with thickened edge 61.00 | S.Y. 85.00 5,185.00 50.00 3,050.00
9. |6" PCC Pavement (coarse aggregate limestone) 423.00 | S.Y. 70.00 29,610.00 40.00 16,920.00
10. |Modified Subbase 60.00 | Ton 65.00 3,900.00 25.00 1,500.00
11. |Pavement Markings (white - 4' wide) 180.00 | L.F. 7.00 1,260.00 4.00 720.00
12. |Clean Black Topsoil 160.00 | C.Y. 50.00 8,000.00 34.00 5,440.00
13. |Seeding & Fertilizing - Urban Mix with Mulch 82.00 | SQ 50.00 4,100.00 50.00 4,100.00
14. |Silt Fence Placement & Removal 120.00 | L.F. 15.00 1,800.00 5.00 600.00
15. |Relocate Basketball Hoop 1.00 | L.S. 2,500.00 2,500.00 1,000.00 1,000.00
16. |Traffic Control 1.00 | L.F. 2,500.00 2,500.00 1,200.00 1,200.00
TOTAL - BASE BID $ 111,744.00 $ 60,806.00
ALTERNATE BID NO. 1
17A.|Pickleball Court - Aslphalt Alternate 800.00 | S.Y. $ 50.00 | $ 40,000.00
TOTAL - BASE BID & ALTERNATE NO. 1 NO BID $ 100,806.00
ALTERNATE BID NO. 2
17B.|Pickleball Court - Reinforced Concrete 800.00 | S.Y.|$ 110.00 [ $ 88,000.00 $ 75.00|$ 60,000.00
TOTAL - BASE BID & ALTERNATE NO. 2 $ 199,744.00 $ 120,806.00
ALTERNATE BID NO. 3
17C.|Pickleball Court - Post-Tensioned Concrete 800.00 | S.Y. $ 100.00 [ $ 80,000.00
TOTAL - BASE BID & ALTERNATE NO. 3 $ 140,806.00
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