
                                                                              BID TABULATION

PROJECT:   2019 Sanitary Sewer Improvements                       ENGINEER:  Jacobson-Westergard & Associates

                      2nd Avenue SW & 8th Street SW                                    105 South 6th Street

                      West Bend, Iowa                E-18126                                    Estherville, Iowa  51334

 

OWNER:  City of West Bend  Page 1 of 2

BID DATE:  March 4, 2019 @ 10:00 a.m.

 

COMPLETION DATE:  September 1, 2019 REDING'S GRAVEL & EXC.            ENGINEER'S

           ESTHERVILLE, IA                ALGONA, IA         LAKE CRYSTAL,MN             WALL LAKE, IA               ESTIMATE

     

   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total

No. Item  Quantity Unit   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price

1. 10" Dia. Gravity PVC SDR26 Sanitary Sewer 496.00 L.F. 30.00$       14,880.00$        57.00$      28,272.00$      74.00$       36,704.00$        113.00$     56,048.00$        60.00$       29,760.00$        

2. 10" Dia. PVC SCH40 Slip-on Caps 1.00 Each 100.00       100.00              575.00      575.00             150.00       150.00              580.00       580.00              75.00         75.00                

3. Standard 48" Dia. Sanitary Manhole (1 each) 6.21 VLF 600.00       3,726.00           750.00      4,657.50          597.09       3,707.93           985.00       6,116.85           400.00       2,484.00           

4. Trench Stabilization 75.00 Ton 28.00         2,100.00           38.00        2,850.00          24.30         1,822.50           35.00         2,625.00           30.00         2,250.00           

5. Class "C" Gravel Surfacing (6" thick) 100.00 Ton 20.00         2,000.00           35.00        3,500.00          18.58         1,858.00           30.00         3,000.00           25.00         2,500.00           

6. Tie to Existing Manhole 2.00 Each 2,500.00    5,000.00           4,100.00   8,200.00          2,626.63    5,253.26           2,500.00    5,000.00           800.00       1,600.00           

7. Pavement Removal 17.00 S.Y. 50.00         850.00              30.00        510.00             12.00         204.00              20.00         340.00              15.00         255.00              

8. 6" HMA Pavement 11.00 S.Y. 150.00       1,650.00           115.00      1,265.00          100.00       1,100.00           110.00       1,210.00           75.00         825.00              

9. 6" x 30" PCC Curb & Gutter 20.00 L.F. 50.00         1,000.00           78.00        1,560.00          40.00         800.00              55.00         1,100.00           20.00         400.00              

10. Class "C" Gravel Subbase (2" thick) 2.00 Ton 28.00         56.00                35.00        70.00               18.58         37.16                90.00         180.00              25.00         50.00                

11. Lower existing watermain 1.00 L.S. 2,500.00    2,500.00           5,150.00   5,150.00          5,533.37    5,533.37           5,000.00    5,000.00           2,000.00    2,000.00           

12. Seeding & Fertilizing (Urban Mixture) 20.00 S.Q. 125.00       2,500.00           198.00      3,960.00          45.00         900.00              110.00       2,200.00           100.00       2,000.00           

13. Traffic Control 1.00 L.S. 7,000.00    7,000.00           4,000.00   4,000.00          33,000.00  33,000.00          2,750.00    2,750.00           3,500.00    3,500.00           

          BASE BID - TOTAL 43,362.00$        64,569.50$      ** 91,070.22$                             86,149.85$        47,699.00$        

  **CONTRACT AWARDED**

   AND ADDRESS:

   BIDDER'S NAME

   AND ADDRESS:

   BIDDER'S NAME

   AND ADDRESS:

KING CONSTRUCTION

   

  

CORY JUERGENS GM CONTRACTING

   BIDDER'S NAME

   AND ADDRESS:

   BIDDER'S NAME



Page 2 of 2

PROJECT:   2019 Sanitary Sewer Improvements

                      2nd Avenue SW & 8th Street SW

                      West Bend, Iowa                E-18126

REDING'S GRAVEL & EXC.            ENGINEER'S

ALTERNATE BID #1           ESTHERVILLE, IA                ALGONA, IA         LAKE CRYSTAL,MN             WALL LAKE, IA               ESTIMATE

     

   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total

No. Item  Quantity Unit   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price

14. 8" Dia. Gravity PVC SDR26 Sanitary Sewer 1,125.00 L.F. 40.00$       45,000.00$        138.00$    155,250.00$    153.00$     172,125.00$      45.00$       50,625.00$        

15. 8" Dia. PVC SCH40 Slip-on Caps 1.00 Each 100.00       100.00              725.00      725.00             400.00       400.00              65.00         65.00                

16. Standard 48" Dia. Sanitary Manhole (5 each) 70.51 VLF 600.00       42,306.00          750.00      52,882.50        620.00       43,716.20          400.00       28,204.00          

17. 4" Diameter PVC SCH40 Sewer Service lines w/fittings 230.00 L.F. 48.00         11,040.00          158.00      36,340.00        135.00       31,050.00          20.00         4,600.00           

18. 8" x 4" Sanitary Sewer Service Saddle 23.00 Each 250.00       5,750.00           935.00      21,505.00        1,000.00    23,000.00          175.00       4,025.00           

19. Trench Stabilization 185.00 Ton 28.00         5,180.00           38.00        7,030.00          35.00         6,475.00           30.00         5,550.00           

20. Existing Manhole Removal 5.00 Each 1,000.00    5,000.00           1,650.00   8,250.00          1,500.00    7,500.00           1,000.00    5,000.00           

21. Pavement Removal 2,520.00 S.Y. 4.00           10,080.00          6.50          16,380.00        14.75         37,170.00          10.00         25,200.00          

22. 6" HMA Pavement 2,520.00 S.Y. 33.00         83,160.00          38.00        95,760.00        39.25         98,910.00          45.00         113,400.00        

23. Class "C" Gravel Subbase (2" thick) 275.00 Ton 18.00         4,950.00           35.00        9,625.00          40.00         11,000.00          25.00         6,875.00           

ALTERNATE BID #1 - TOTAL 212,566.00$      403,747.50$    NO BID                      431,346.20$      243,544.00$      

 

PROJECT:   2019 Sanitary Sewer Improvements

                      2nd Avenue SW & 8th Street SW

                      West Bend, Iowa                E-18126

REDING'S GRAVEL & EXC.            ENGINEER'S

ALTERNATE BID #2           ESTHERVILLE, IA                ALGONA, IA         LAKE CRYSTAL,MN             WALL LAKE, IA               ESTIMATE

     

   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total

No. Item  Quantity Unit   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price

14. 8" Dia. Gravity PVC SDR26 Sanitary Sewer

(directionally drilled) 1,127.00 L.F. 68.86$       77,605.22$        155.00$     174,685.00$      140.00       157,780.00        

15. 8" Dia. PVC SCH40 Slip-on Caps 1.00 Each 75.00         75.00                500.00       500.00              65.00         65.00                

16. Standard 48" Dia. Sanitary Manhole (4 each) 63.49 VLF 730.00       46,347.70          760.00       48,252.40          400.00       25,396.00          

17. Tie to Existing Manhole 1.00 Each 4,618.24    4,618.24           3,700.00    3,700.00           1,000.00    1,000.00           

18. Pavement Removal 180.00 S.Y. 12.00         2,160.00           15.00         2,700.00           20.00         3,600.00           

19. 6" HMA Pavement 180.00 S.Y. 45.50         8,190.00           47.50         8,550.00           70.00         12,600.00          

20. Class "C" Gravel Subbase (2" thick) 20.00 Ton 18.58         371.60              55.00         1,100.00           25.00         500.00              

ALTERNATE BID #2 - TOTAL NO BID NO BID 139,367.76$                           239,487.40$      200,941.00$      

BASE BID & ALTERNATE #1 - TOTAL 255,928.00$      468,317.00$    NO BID                      517,496.05$      291,243.00$      

BASE BID & ALTERNATE #2 - TOTAL NO BID NO BID ** 230,437.98$                           325,637.25$      248,640.00$      

**CONTRACT AWARDED**

CORY JUERGENS GM CONTRACTING KING CONSTRUCTION

   

   AND ADDRESS:    AND ADDRESS:    AND ADDRESS:    AND ADDRESS:   

CORY JUERGENS GM CONTRACTING KING CONSTRUCTION

   BIDDER'S NAME    BIDDER'S NAME    BIDDER'S NAME    BIDDER'S NAME

   BIDDER'S NAME    

   AND ADDRESS:    AND ADDRESS:    AND ADDRESS:    AND ADDRESS:   

   BIDDER'S NAME    BIDDER'S NAME    BIDDER'S NAME


